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Physics of God attempts to find and explain the ultimate reality, God, using laws of modern physics. It
inaugurates a new intellectual order by realizing the much talked about and hyped but still awaited joining of
science and God; reason and faith; physics and metaphysics. It proposes a new hypothesis that borders
science and imagination. This work is a serious confluence of physics, philosophy, metaphysics, theosophy
and theology written with a pen, which is youthful and bubbly. Jampak Zu, the virtual cartoon character who
has coauthored this book with Kartikey is an innovation in itself. The work brings out seven levels of reality
that constitute the cosmic existence. Human existence participates in all of them. It lists the seven important
parameters of reality and establishes a canonical interrelationship between them all. Laws of physics are then
extrapolated into the realm of nonphysical worlds using these interparametric relations. The seven
parameters work like seven interconnected knobs. By turning their values, the reader is made to undergo a
journey from one world to another. At the climax of analysis, the reader finds himself in the world of God.
The ultimate reality reveals itself automatically and spontaneously with a pleasant surprise that even God
does not violate the laws of physics. We see Him through the lens of physics."
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From reader reviews:

Emma Lavigne:

Hey guys, do you wants to finds a new book to read? May be the book with the headline Physics Of God
suitable to you? The book was written by renowned writer in this era. The particular book untitled Physics
Of Godis a single of several books that will everyone read now. That book was inspired lots of people in the
world. When you read this publication you will enter the new way of measuring that you ever know before.
The author explained their plan in the simple way, therefore all of people can easily to recognise the core of
this book. This book will give you a wide range of information about this world now. So you can see the
represented of the world within this book.

Todd Voss:

The publication with title Physics Of God contains a lot of information that you can understand it. You can
get a lot of advantage after read this book. This book exist new knowledge the information that exist in this
guide represented the condition of the world currently. That is important to yo7u to be aware of how the
improvement of the world. This specific book will bring you throughout new era of the internationalization.
You can read the e-book on your smart phone, so you can read that anywhere you want.

Cindi Russell:

Precisely why? Because this Physics Of God is an unordinary book that the inside of the e-book waiting for
you to snap the idea but latter it will distress you with the secret it inside. Reading this book next to it was
fantastic author who else write the book in such remarkable way makes the content within easier to
understand, entertaining approach but still convey the meaning completely. So , it is good for you because of
not hesitating having this any more or you going to regret it. This amazing book will give you a lot of
positive aspects than the other book possess such as help improving your ability and your critical thinking
way. So , still want to postpone having that book? If I were you I will go to the book store hurriedly.

William Reyes:

Reading can called imagination hangout, why? Because when you find yourself reading a book specifically
book entitled Physics Of God the mind will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in every aspect
that maybe not known for but surely can be your mind friends. Imaging just about every word written in a e-
book then become one application form conclusion and explanation that will maybe you never get prior to.
The Physics Of God giving you an additional experience more than blown away your mind but also giving
you useful data for your better life in this era. So now let us present to you the relaxing pattern here is your
body and mind will be pleased when you are finished reading it, like winning a game. Do you want to try this
extraordinary investing spare time activity?
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