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When in Rome, do as Audrey Hepburn would do. Failing that, run off with your ex-boyfriend, carry
suspicious packages through customs, and lie to the person who loves you. . . .

Georgie Beauchamp is totally happy and in love with her wonderful, dependable boyfriend, David. So why
does she always daydream about running into her gorgeous ex-boyfriend Mike? It can’t mean she’s still in
love with him—especially since the cad dumped her so horribly. As luck would have it, when Georgie’s
daydream actually comes true, she is dressed in unglamorous sweats and carrying a curtain rod down the
street, while Mike is driving an expensive sports car and looking better than Brad Pitt at the Oscars. She
longs to have the glamorous life Mike can offer—and starts to think that he might want her back in his arms.

But when he invites her for a weekend in Rome, Georgie is torn. David has always said he’d take her there
for the romantic getaway of a lifetime, but his work keeps him totally tied up. So she must choose: David, all
comfort and reliability, or Mike, all flirtation and butterfly-stomachs. The decision isn’t too hard to make,
and faster than she can say Vespa, she’s off to Rome with Mike, full of plans to frolic on the Spanish Steps
and sip wine in intimate trattorias. But when David shows up unexpectedly, this roman holiday gets a hell of
a lot more complicated. . . .

From the Trade Paperback edition.
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From reader reviews:

Stanley Roman:

Spent a free the perfect time to be fun activity to accomplish! A lot of people spent their down time with
their family, or all their friends. Usually they carrying out activity like watching television, going to beach,
or picnic inside park. They actually doing ditto every week. Do you feel it? Will you something different to
fill your personal free time/ holiday? Might be reading a book may be option to fill your cost-free time/
holiday. The first thing that you ask may be what kinds of publication that you should read. If you want to
test look for book, may be the reserve untitled When in Rome...: A Novel of Piazzas and Passion can be very
good book to read. May be it can be best activity to you.

Amanda Doss:

Is it an individual who having spare time in that case spend it whole day by means of watching television
programs or just laying on the bed? Do you need something new? This When in Rome...: A Novel of Piazzas
and Passion can be the reply, oh how comes? It's a book you know. You are so out of date, spending your
time by reading in this brand-new era is common not a geek activity. So what these publications have than
the others?

Nathan Strong:

A lot of reserve has printed but it is different. You can get it by world wide web on social media. You can
choose the very best book for you, science, amusing, novel, or whatever by means of searching from it. It is
called of book When in Rome...: A Novel of Piazzas and Passion. You can add your knowledge by it.
Without leaving the printed book, it may add your knowledge and make anyone happier to read. It is most
critical that, you must aware about book. It can bring you from one location to other place.

William Bottoms:

Reading a publication make you to get more knowledge as a result. You can take knowledge and information
originating from a book. Book is composed or printed or created from each source in which filled update of
news. On this modern era like today, many ways to get information are available for a person. From media
social including newspaper, magazines, science book, encyclopedia, reference book, fresh and comic. You
can add your understanding by that book. Are you hip to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just
searching for the When in Rome...: A Novel of Piazzas and Passion when you essential it?
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