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Sir Alfred Stephen (1802-1894) was descended from generations of Stephens celebrated in England for their
contributions to the law, literature, politics and public administration. A creature of the nineteenth century,
Sir Alfred personified its values. Born at St Kitts, educated in England and there called to the Bar, he at first
progressed so slowly that he decided to return to the colonies. As a pioneer Crown Law Officer in Tasmania
he was ambitious, aggressive, and astonishingly successful financially. But, lacking tact, he fell out with the
Lt-Governor and the judiciary. Taking another chance, he accepted a temporary judgeship at Sydney (1839),
won immediate respect, and became Chief Justice (1844), serving with great accomplishment until 1873 - a
term never equaled in New South Wales. He was first President of the Legislative Council after Responsible
Government (1856), returning to the Council on resigning as Chief Justice. His many public services
included being Lt-Governor; helping to establish The University of Sydney; and supporting such institutions
as hospitals, museums and art galleries. Despite the difficulty, on a fixed income, of providing for his many
children, he was great philanthropist. His name and works, now much forgotten, but of world renown in his
day, are recalled in this biography by Dr John Michael Bennett, AM, whose project to write it was awarded
the 2006 News South Wales History Fellowship. The NSW State Set of Lives of Australian Chief Justices,
which includes, Sir Francis Forbes, Sir James Dowling, Sir Alfred Stephen and Sir James Martin is available
for $160.00 - to order the NSW State Set, click here.
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From reader reviews:

Rachel Robertson:

Within other case, little people like to read book Sir Alfred Stephen: Third Chief Justice of New South
Wales, 1844-1873 (Lives of Australian Chief Justices). You can choose the best book if you'd prefer reading
a book. Given that we know about how is important some sort of book Sir Alfred Stephen: Third Chief
Justice of New South Wales, 1844-1873 (Lives of Australian Chief Justices). You can add understanding and
of course you can around the world by way of a book. Absolutely right, because from book you can learn
everything! From your country until foreign or abroad you will be known. About simple point until
wonderful thing you may know that. In this era, we are able to open a book or maybe searching by internet
product. It is called e-book. You can utilize it when you feel bored stiff to go to the library. Let's go through.

Frank Johnson:

Book is to be different per grade. Book for children until adult are different content. We all know that that
book is very important for people. The book Sir Alfred Stephen: Third Chief Justice of New South Wales,
1844-1873 (Lives of Australian Chief Justices) was making you to know about other information and of
course you can take more information. It is rather advantages for you. The e-book Sir Alfred Stephen: Third
Chief Justice of New South Wales, 1844-1873 (Lives of Australian Chief Justices) is not only giving you far
more new information but also being your friend when you really feel bored. You can spend your own
personal spend time to read your e-book. Try to make relationship together with the book Sir Alfred Stephen:
Third Chief Justice of New South Wales, 1844-1873 (Lives of Australian Chief Justices). You never
experience lose out for everything in case you read some books.

Bertram Staten:

Information is provisions for those to get better life, information nowadays can get by anyone at everywhere.
The information can be a understanding or any news even a problem. What people must be consider if those
information which is from the former life are challenging to be find than now is taking seriously which one is
suitable to believe or which one the particular resource are convinced. If you have the unstable resource then
you have it as your main information it will have huge disadvantage for you. All of those possibilities will
not happen inside you if you take Sir Alfred Stephen: Third Chief Justice of New South Wales, 1844-1873
(Lives of Australian Chief Justices) as your daily resource information.

Blake Westerman:

Spent a free a chance to be fun activity to try and do! A lot of people spent their leisure time with their
family, or their very own friends. Usually they performing activity like watching television, gonna beach, or
picnic inside the park. They actually doing same thing every week. Do you feel it? Do you want to
something different to fill your current free time/ holiday? May be reading a book can be option to fill your
no cost time/ holiday. The first thing that you ask may be what kinds of publication that you should read. If



you want to consider look for book, may be the publication untitled Sir Alfred Stephen: Third Chief Justice
of New South Wales, 1844-1873 (Lives of Australian Chief Justices) can be good book to read. May be it
might be best activity to you.
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