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APCOM 2015: Your key to effective decision making and staying
current with the rapidly evolving minerals industry.

The symposium series on the Application of Computers and Operations Research in the Mineral Industry
(APCOM) was initiated by The University of Arizona in 1961. Since then, APCOM has become an
international forum for presentation, discussion, and criticism of the state-of-the-art and emerging
technologies in the fields of computer and operations research applications applied to the broad minerals
industry.

With 113 peer-reviewed papers from all mineral industry sectors?industry, academia, and government
agencies?the 37th APCOM proceedings holds the latest knowledge and the most current best practices to
incorporate computer technology into mining operations and mining public relations.

The mining operations topics cover sophisticated new engineering techniques to identify better mineral
deposits and extract them more efficiently in a safer, bettermanaged mine using the latest tools in
geometallurgy, geostatistics, mine design, production planning, 2D and 3D modeling, simulations, mine
automation, rock mechanics, mineral processing, and unconventional energy resources. Mining public
relations topics, broadly defined, cover not just publicity and outreach but regulatory compliance?winning
over neighbors, environmental activists, and other stakeholders?and designing interfaces and training tools
using virtual reality and other cutting-edge applications.

A few of the highlights include how to:

Apply the lessons of ant colonies to optimize pipeline routes?and lessons from genetic algorithms to dig●

better with draglines,
Find the economic optimum depth for jointly operating underground and open pit mines,●

Reduce energy costs by using magnetic-powered hoist systems and other new technologies, and●

Identify (and thus address) dust dispersion problems before they occur.●
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From reader reviews:

Florence Taylor:

The e-book untitled Application of Computers and Operations Research in the Mineral Industry: Proceedings
of the 37th International Symposium is the book that recommended to you to learn. You can see the quality
of the book content that will be shown to you actually. The language that article author use to explained their
ideas are easily to understand. The article writer was did a lot of research when write the book, hence the
information that they share for you is absolutely accurate. You also can get the e-book of Application of
Computers and Operations Research in the Mineral Industry: Proceedings of the 37th International
Symposium from the publisher to make you much more enjoy free time.

Eric Hempel:

The book untitled Application of Computers and Operations Research in the Mineral Industry: Proceedings
of the 37th International Symposium contain a lot of information on that. The writer explains the girl idea
with easy method. The language is very clear and understandable all the people, so do certainly not worry,
you can easy to read the idea. The book was written by famous author. The author will bring you in the new
age of literary works. It is possible to read this book because you can keep reading your smart phone, or
model, so you can read the book throughout anywhere and anytime. In a situation you wish to purchase the
e-book, you can open up their official web-site and order it. Have a nice learn.

Kyra Franson:

Is it an individual who having spare time then spend it whole day through watching television programs or
just laying on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Application of Computers and Operations
Research in the Mineral Industry: Proceedings of the 37th International Symposium can be the answer, oh
how comes? A book you know. You are so out of date, spending your extra time by reading in this brand-
new era is common not a geek activity. So what these ebooks have than the others?

Jessica Palmer:

As we know that book is important thing to add our expertise for everything. By a publication we can know
everything we wish. A book is a set of written, printed, illustrated or even blank sheet. Every year had been
exactly added. This e-book Application of Computers and Operations Research in the Mineral Industry:
Proceedings of the 37th International Symposium was filled about science. Spend your time to add your
knowledge about your technology competence. Some people has diverse feel when they reading a new book.
If you know how big selling point of a book, you can sense enjoy to read a book. In the modern era like
currently, many ways to get book you wanted.
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