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TRIGGER WARNING: This book deals with the sensitive subjects of surviving rape, trauma suffered during
combat, child abuse, and possible sterility. If you have issues with these elements, this book might not be for
you.

Raped. Tortured. Beaten. Essie Santiago’s life fell apart when she was sixteen, and it’s taken eight years to
put it back together. There are some pieces that can never be mended; it would take a miracle for her to get
pregnant, and physical closeness is something that makes her shudder. Only her love of creating beauty in
the form of fashion gets her through the worst of the darkness.

When a mortar attack destroyed half his face and all of his life as he knew it, something vital died inside of
former Marine, Ezekiel Steele. For years he’s felt nothing… until he sees Essie trying her best to be
invisible. But the feisty spark inside the lovely fashion designer is too bright to be concealed, and like a moth
to a flame, he’s helpless to resist her.

Chicago’s premiere tattoo studio, House Of Payne, is taking the world of fashion by storm, holding a contest
to find the best designer the city has to offer. Competition is fierce, but all Essie can concentrate on are
Steele’s dirty-talking lessons in sex. But when the student surpasses the master when it comes to love,
Steele’s inner demons get the better of him. If he can't face them down, he’ll lose Essie forever.

123,000 words

***This standalone, mildly erotic contemporary romance contains a dirty-talking Alpha with a penchant for
having sex in public places. No cheating, no love triangles and no cliffhangers. Fairy tale HEA guaranteed.
Due to adult language and sexual content, this book is not intended for people under the age of 18***
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From reader reviews:

Joy Hanson:

Book is to be different for each grade. Book for children right up until adult are different content. As you
may know that book is very important usually. The book House Of Payne: Steele was making you to know
about other know-how and of course you can take more information. It is rather advantages for you. The
guide House Of Payne: Steele is not only giving you considerably more new information but also being your
friend when you really feel bored. You can spend your own spend time to read your book. Try to make
relationship while using book House Of Payne: Steele. You never feel lose out for everything when you read
some books.

Leroy Ange:

Is it an individual who having spare time subsequently spend it whole day by simply watching television
programs or just lying on the bed? Do you need something new? This House Of Payne: Steele can be the
response, oh how comes? A fresh book you know. You are therefore out of date, spending your free time by
reading in this brand-new era is common not a geek activity. So what these ebooks have than the others?

David Wood:

You can get this House Of Payne: Steele by visit the bookstore or Mall. Just viewing or reviewing it may to
be your solve problem if you get difficulties to your knowledge. Kinds of this guide are various. Not only
simply by written or printed but in addition can you enjoy this book by e-book. In the modern era similar to
now, you just looking from your mobile phone and searching what your problem. Right now, choose your
current ways to get more information about your e-book. It is most important to arrange yourself to make
your knowledge are still up-date. Let's try to choose suitable ways for you.

Laurel Ramer:

Some people said that they feel uninterested when they reading a e-book. They are directly felt the idea when
they get a half portions of the book. You can choose typically the book House Of Payne: Steele to make your
own personal reading is interesting. Your own skill of reading ability is developing when you including
reading. Try to choose basic book to make you enjoy you just read it and mingle the sensation about book
and reading through especially. It is to be initially opinion for you to like to open up a book and study it.
Beside that the book House Of Payne: Steele can to be your friend when you're feel alone and confuse in
what must you're doing of these time.
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