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This great work of St Gregory Palamas is an exposition of a spiritual tradition that has been practised, tried
and tested for over 1600 years. Palamas describes the difference between worldly and spiritual knowledge,
the nature of illumination and how the action of the divine may be encountered within us.

It was written almost 700 years ago in support of the practice of hesychasm - the path of inner stillness,
which originated in the fourth century - a practice that perhaps has greater relevance today than ever before.
In an age when the West prefers to look East in search of a spiritual tradition, to the practices of yoga, zen or
Sufism, it is a surprise to discover that there is an authentic and unbroken Western tradition, stretching back
nearly two millennia, that has continually offered the 'living water' of a way followed by numerous saints.
Although hesychasm was developed by hermits and monks, aspects of it can equally be practised by those of
us living in the world today. This is made clear in the Commentary by Robin Amis, who puts hesychasm into
a modern context and shows how we can all benefit from this ancient tradition that leads to 'the stillness that
knows God'.
The Palamas text was originally published in 2002 as 'The Triads: Book One'. This edition is a substantially
revised translation of the original text and features an additional Commentary by the author Robin Amis.
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From reader reviews:

Bethel Stockton:

Do you certainly one of people who can't read pleasurable if the sentence chained in the straightway, hold on
guys this aren't like that. This Holy Hesychia: The Stillness That Knows God book is readable by you who
hate those straight word style. You will find the facts here are arrange for enjoyable reading through
experience without leaving possibly decrease the knowledge that want to provide to you. The writer of Holy
Hesychia: The Stillness That Knows God content conveys objective easily to understand by many
individuals. The printed and e-book are not different in the information but it just different as it. So , do you
still thinking Holy Hesychia: The Stillness That Knows God is not loveable to be your top collection reading
book?

Dustin Kellett:

Do you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt if you find yourself in the book store?
Attempt to pick one book that you find out the inside because don't evaluate book by its include may doesn't
work the following is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not while fantastic as in
the outside look likes. Maybe you answer is usually Holy Hesychia: The Stillness That Knows God why
because the fantastic cover that make you consider in regards to the content will not disappoint an individual.
The inside or content is actually fantastic as the outside or maybe cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly
direct you to pick up this book.

Cynthia Campbell:

The book untitled Holy Hesychia: The Stillness That Knows God contain a lot of information on that. The
writer explains the girl idea with easy approach. The language is very simple to implement all the people, so
do certainly not worry, you can easy to read the item. The book was compiled by famous author. The author
provides you in the new period of time of literary works. It is possible to read this book because you can read
on your smart phone, or gadget, so you can read the book within anywhere and anytime. If you want to buy
the e-book, you can available their official web-site along with order it. Have a nice read.

Bradley Cox:

Do you like reading a e-book? Confuse to looking for your best book? Or your book was rare? Why so many
question for the book? But any people feel that they enjoy with regard to reading. Some people likes reading
through, not only science book but novel and Holy Hesychia: The Stillness That Knows God or perhaps
others sources were given know-how for you. After you know how the truly amazing a book, you feel would
like to read more and more. Science publication was created for teacher or perhaps students especially.
Those books are helping them to put their knowledge. In other case, beside science e-book, any other book
likes Holy Hesychia: The Stillness That Knows God to make your spare time considerably more colorful.
Many types of book like this.
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