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Preston Love's resume reads like a Who's Who of American music: member of the Count Basie Band during
its heyday in the 40s, studio musician in Los Angeles, cohort of Jo Jones, Lester Young, Ray Charles, and
Dizzy Gillespie, and back-up player for Marvin Gaye, the Temptations, Smokey Robinson, Aretha Franklin,
Gladys Knight, and Stevie Wonder. In this autobiography Love shows that, while the music centers of New
York, New Orleans, Chicago, and Kansas City nurtured the development of those uniquely African
American forms, jazz and the Motown sound, significant contributions were also being made by territory
bands tirelessly performing in outposts like St. Cloud, Minnesota, Guthrie, Oklahoma, and Honey Creek,
Iowa.

It was in the latter town where Love, a 15-year-old from the black ghetto of Omaha, made his musical debut.
Captivated by the sweet alto sax sounds of Earle Warren, Love took up the instrument and within a decade
was sitting in Warren's chair. But Love's personal odyssey is more than a chronicle of endless bus rides, bad
crowds in backwater clubs, and feast-or-famine finances endured en route to the top. In a distinctive and
passionate voice he outlines significant facets of African American history: the central importance of the
family in musical development, institutional racism in American popular culture, and the interracial nature of
the music world. He also describes the growth of the music industry, especially Motown, what he calls "the
powerful colossus from Detroit." Love's story, told with uncanny memory and unfailing honesty, provides an
important view into the career of a musician and the evolution of a major musical form.
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From reader reviews:

Angel Garcia:

With other case, little people like to read book A Thousand Honey Creeks Later: My Life in Music from
Basie to Motown_and Beyond (Music/Culture). You can choose the best book if you love reading a book. As
long as we know about how is important a book A Thousand Honey Creeks Later: My Life in Music from
Basie to Motown_and Beyond (Music/Culture). You can add expertise and of course you can around the
world by just a book. Absolutely right, since from book you can understand everything! From your country
until foreign or abroad you will find yourself known. About simple factor until wonderful thing you can
know that. In this era, you can open a book or maybe searching by internet device. It is called e-book. You
can use it when you feel weary to go to the library. Let's read.

Edward Rideout:

Exactly why? Because this A Thousand Honey Creeks Later: My Life in Music from Basie to Motown_and
Beyond (Music/Culture) is an unordinary book that the inside of the publication waiting for you to snap the
item but latter it will zap you with the secret the idea inside. Reading this book adjacent to it was fantastic
author who write the book in such awesome way makes the content inside easier to understand, entertaining
approach but still convey the meaning thoroughly. So , it is good for you for not hesitating having this any
longer or you going to regret it. This amazing book will give you a lot of gains than the other book get such
as help improving your skill and your critical thinking technique. So , still want to delay having that book? If
I have been you I will go to the guide store hurriedly.

Kathryn Robinson:

Playing with family in the park, coming to see the coastal world or hanging out with buddies is thing that
usually you could have done when you have spare time, subsequently why you don't try matter that really
opposite from that. Just one activity that make you not experience tired but still relaxing, trilling like on
roller coaster you are ride on and with addition details. Even you love A Thousand Honey Creeks Later: My
Life in Music from Basie to Motown_and Beyond (Music/Culture), you may enjoy both. It is good
combination right, you still would like to miss it? What kind of hang type is it? Oh can occur its mind
hangout guys. What? Still don't understand it, oh come on its known as reading friends.

Laura Dupont:

A lot of reserve has printed but it differs from the others. You can get it by online on social media. You can
choose the most effective book for you, science, witty, novel, or whatever by searching from it. It is called of
book A Thousand Honey Creeks Later: My Life in Music from Basie to Motown_and Beyond
(Music/Culture). You can contribute your knowledge by it. Without leaving behind the printed book, it may
add your knowledge and make you actually happier to read. It is most crucial that, you must aware about
guide. It can bring you from one place to other place.
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