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Hygge (hoo-gah) is a Danish word but a universal feeling of being warm, safe, comforted, and
sheltered—an experience of belonging to the moment and to each other. When life gets hectic, work
grows stressful, and the days fly by, unplug and tune in. 

Hygge anchors us, reminding us to slow down, to connect with place and with one another, to dwell and
savor rather than rush and spend. 

When you curl up by the fire with a blanket, or have a simple meal with friends, that is hygge. When you
acknowledge the sacred in the secular, or focus on people rather than things, or when you express love
through small gestures, that is hygge. 

The Book of Hygge is an invitation to welcome abundance and contentment into your life. It is a call to live
more fully by focusing on what moves you.
 
With beautiful full-color photographs and instructive meditations on relishing the everyday, it is your perfect
guide to cultivating the coziness that has made Danes the happiest people in the world. The Book of Hygge is
designed with an unjacketed, textured cover and crisp, clean interiors.

As seen in the The New Yorker, a cure for SAD in book form.
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From reader reviews:

Raymond Custer:

The book The Book of Hygge: The Danish Art of Contentment, Comfort, and Connection can give more
knowledge and information about everything you want. Why then must we leave a very important thing like
a book The Book of Hygge: The Danish Art of Contentment, Comfort, and Connection? A few of you have a
different opinion about e-book. But one aim this book can give many details for us. It is absolutely suitable.
Right now, try to closer using your book. Knowledge or data that you take for that, you can give for each
other; it is possible to share all of these. Book The Book of Hygge: The Danish Art of Contentment,
Comfort, and Connection has simple shape however, you know: it has great and large function for you. You
can look the enormous world by available and read a publication. So it is very wonderful.

Ernest Keeler:

Information is provisions for anyone to get better life, information these days can get by anyone on
everywhere. The information can be a knowledge or any news even a huge concern. What people must be
consider if those information which is in the former life are difficult to be find than now could be taking
seriously which one is acceptable to believe or which one the actual resource are convinced. If you obtain the
unstable resource then you buy it as your main information you will have huge disadvantage for you. All of
those possibilities will not happen throughout you if you take The Book of Hygge: The Danish Art of
Contentment, Comfort, and Connection as your daily resource information.

Guadalupe Marshall:

Beside that The Book of Hygge: The Danish Art of Contentment, Comfort, and Connection in your phone, it
can give you a way to get more close to the new knowledge or info. The information and the knowledge you
are going to got here is fresh from the oven so don't be worry if you feel like an older people live in narrow
village. It is good thing to have The Book of Hygge: The Danish Art of Contentment, Comfort, and
Connection because this book offers for your requirements readable information. Do you sometimes have
book but you don't get what it's about. Oh come on, that will not end up to happen if you have this in your
hand. The Enjoyable blend here cannot be questionable, such as treasuring beautiful island. So do you still
want to miss that? Find this book and also read it from currently!

Patsy Phan:

As a student exactly feel bored to reading. If their teacher expected them to go to the library in order to make
summary for some book, they are complained. Just small students that has reading's spirit or real their hobby.
They just do what the instructor want, like asked to the library. They go to generally there but nothing
reading seriously. Any students feel that reading through is not important, boring and also can't see colorful
images on there. Yeah, it is to become complicated. Book is very important to suit your needs. As we know
that on this age, many ways to get whatever we want. Likewise word says, ways to reach Chinese's country.



So , this The Book of Hygge: The Danish Art of Contentment, Comfort, and Connection can make you truly
feel more interested to read.
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