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When Doug Croft lost his parents to a drunk driver as a child, his uncle Harold took him in. Years later,
Doug has grown to adulthood when Harold passes away and leaves everything to his nephew, including a
sizeable property and home at 66 Valdera Street. Doug now has a house and a good job at the local shipyard.
He just needs someone to share his life with. By chance, he meets twenty-two-year-old Lurene Stafford, a
beautiful, single waitress at the diner where Doug goes for lunch every day. He's immediately drawn to her,
soon finding himself in love. Although Lurene doesn't really love Doug in return, she accepts his marriage
proposal, looking for financial security. Before too long, things begin take a nose - dive for Doug. He loses
his shipyard job due to a lay-off and his tenants move out along with other setbacks. Lurene meets Steve
Hobbs at her work and rents their vacant apartment to him. Lurene falls hard for Steve not knowing that he is
a criminal with dangerous associates and is planning a major theft. Doug's enviable life begins to crumble
with truly unexpected results.
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From reader reviews:

Donna Young:

Now a day people who Living in the era where everything reachable by match the internet and the resources
inside it can be true or not require people to be aware of each details they get. How people have to be smart
in obtaining any information nowadays? Of course the correct answer is reading a book. Examining a book
can help persons out of this uncertainty Information specially this 66 Valdera Street book as this book offers
you rich information and knowledge. Of course the data in this book hundred pct guarantees there is no
doubt in it you know.

Kathleen Blackwood:

Nowadays reading books are more than want or need but also work as a life style. This reading addiction
give you lot of advantages. The huge benefits you got of course the knowledge the actual information inside
the book in which improve your knowledge and information. The information you get based on what kind of
reserve you read, if you want send more knowledge just go with schooling books but if you want truly feel
happy read one together with theme for entertaining such as comic or novel. Typically the 66 Valdera Street
is kind of publication which is giving the reader capricious experience.

Vicky Gamez:

This 66 Valdera Street tend to be reliable for you who want to be described as a successful person, why. The
reason why of this 66 Valdera Street can be one of the great books you must have is definitely giving you
more than just simple looking at food but feed an individual with information that might be will shock your
preceding knowledge. This book is handy, you can bring it everywhere you go and whenever your conditions
throughout the e-book and printed types. Beside that this 66 Valdera Street forcing you to have an enormous
of experience such as rich vocabulary, giving you tryout of critical thinking that we realize it useful in your
day action. So , let's have it appreciate reading.

Craig Rushing:

Reading a book make you to get more knowledge from this. You can take knowledge and information
originating from a book. Book is composed or printed or descriptive from each source this filled update of
news. In this particular modern era like today, many ways to get information are available for a person. From
media social like newspaper, magazines, science book, encyclopedia, reference book, story and comic. You
can add your understanding by that book. Are you hip to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or
just searching for the 66 Valdera Street when you desired it?
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