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This book offers a complete bibliographical presentation of Syriac authors and texts in the domain of Syriac
asceticism and mysticism. It also includes Greek texts that were translated into Syriac and profoundly
influenced the spiritual life of Christians in the Near and Middle East. Among the Syrian Churches ascetic
and mystical literature was flourishing over the centuries and witnesses the intensity of their religious life. It
also enriched the spirituality of other Christian traditions. Therefore, the bibliography also indicates
Medieval translations of Syriac texts into other languages. The list of authors and texts ranges from Ps.-
Clement of Rome and Antony the Great to the Chaldean Patriarch Joseph II (1696-1713/4). Editions (if
available), translations and secondary literature are arranged in chronological order. Additionally, subject
sections present surveys and introductions to the topic as well as literature about Syriac proto-monasticism,
monastic anthologies, mystical experience and Messalianism in the Syriac tradition. The introduction of the
book highlights the importance and originality of the Syriac ascetic and mystical literature.
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From reader reviews:

Bruce Hardin:

Are you kind of stressful person, only have 10 or perhaps 15 minute in your day to upgrading your mind
ability or thinking skill actually analytical thinking? Then you are receiving problem with the book compared
to can satisfy your small amount of time to read it because this all time you only find reserve that need more
time to be study. A Bibliography of Syriac Ascetic and Mystical Literature (Eastern Christian Studies) can be
your answer since it can be read by you who have those short spare time problems.

Joe Garner:

Reading a book to become new life style in this yr; every people loves to study a book. When you go through
a book you can get a wide range of benefit. When you read textbooks, you can improve your knowledge,
simply because book has a lot of information onto it. The information that you will get depend on what
forms of book that you have read. If you wish to get information about your review, you can read education
books, but if you act like you want to entertain yourself read a fiction books, this sort of us novel, comics, as
well as soon. The A Bibliography of Syriac Ascetic and Mystical Literature (Eastern Christian Studies) will
give you new experience in reading through a book.

Penny Risley:

Is it an individual who having spare time and then spend it whole day by means of watching television
programs or just resting on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This A Bibliography of Syriac
Ascetic and Mystical Literature (Eastern Christian Studies) can be the answer, oh how comes? A fresh book
you know. You are thus out of date, spending your free time by reading in this brand new era is common not
a nerd activity. So what these textbooks have than the others?

Pamela Dodge:

That book can make you to feel relax. This specific book A Bibliography of Syriac Ascetic and Mystical
Literature (Eastern Christian Studies) was colorful and of course has pictures on the website. As we know
that book A Bibliography of Syriac Ascetic and Mystical Literature (Eastern Christian Studies) has many
kinds or type. Start from kids until teenagers. For example Naruto or Detective Conan you can read and think
you are the character on there. Therefore not at all of book tend to be make you bored, any it offers up you
feel happy, fun and unwind. Try to choose the best book to suit your needs and try to like reading that.
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