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In the last decade, the Internet has grown from a network that connected a few universities and research
centers to a network that links many businesses and households all over the country. That expansion
occurred for many reasons, but the technological advance that facilitated this growth was an obscure protocol
called PPP.PPP isn't talked about as much as TCP and IP, but it plays a crucial role in extending networks
into remote locations. The Point-to-Point Protocol enables telephone lines and other point-to-point
connections to carry Internet traffic. It's the protocol that establishes and maintains the connection between
your home and an Internet service provider. This book provides in-depth coverage of PPP for network
administrators and others who are involved in the care and maintenance of PPP connections. It provides a
thorough introduction to how PPP works, which will help you diagnose and troubleshoot problems. It
discusses in detail how to set up dial-in and dial-out PPP on the most important platforms, including
Windows, Linux, and Solaris. Whether you're a sophisticated user responsible for your own connection or a
network administrator providing dial-up services for hundreds of remote users, you'll find this book an
essential addition to your library. Covers:

PPP implementations in Windows 95/98/NT, Solaris, and Linux●

Authentication (CHAP, PAP, Microsoft variants, and other techniques)●

Virtual networks and tunnels, including PPTP●

Modems and serial lines●

Related technologies, including DNS and ARP●

Optimizing and customizing a connection●

Debugging techniques●
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From reader reviews:

Gary Johnson:

What do you with regards to book? It is not important with you? Or just adding material when you really
need something to explain what the ones you have problem? How about your time? Or are you busy
particular person? If you don't have spare time to perform others business, it is make you feel bored faster.
And you have time? What did you do? Everybody has many questions above. They have to answer that
question due to the fact just their can do in which. It said that about guide. Book is familiar on every person.
Yes, it is appropriate. Because start from on kindergarten until university need this particular Using and
Managing PPP: Help for Network Administrators to read.

Stan Smith:

Nowadays reading books become more than want or need but also be a life style. This reading addiction give
you lot of advantages. Advantages you got of course the knowledge the rest of the information inside the
book that will improve your knowledge and information. The info you get based on what kind of publication
you read, if you want get more knowledge just go with schooling books but if you want sense happy read one
having theme for entertaining for example comic or novel. The actual Using and Managing PPP: Help for
Network Administrators is kind of publication which is giving the reader erratic experience.

Linda Howard:

The actual book Using and Managing PPP: Help for Network Administrators has a lot details on it. So when
you make sure to read this book you can get a lot of profit. The book was published by the very famous
author. Tom makes some research just before write this book. This kind of book very easy to read you can
find the point easily after perusing this book.

Sean Rusin:

In this era globalization it is important to someone to receive information. The information will make you to
definitely understand the condition of the world. The condition of the world makes the information simpler
to share. You can find a lot of references to get information example: internet, classifieds, book, and soon.
You can observe that now, a lot of publisher that print many kinds of book. Often the book that
recommended to your account is Using and Managing PPP: Help for Network Administrators this e-book
consist a lot of the information in the condition of this world now. This kind of book was represented just
how can the world has grown up. The words styles that writer use for explain it is easy to understand. Often
the writer made some research when he makes this book. That's why this book ideal all of you.
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